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IBM To Conduct Interview Clinic In Merrick Hall 
On Thursday, November 1, 

employees of International 
Business Machines (IBM), 
from Boston, Massachusetts, 
will conduct an interview clinic 
in Merrick Hall auditorium to 
help prepare students for their 
future by bringing real world 
experiences into the university 
setting. 

Topics to be discussed are 
"How to Succeed in In­
dustry", 9-10 a.m. and 3-4 

DeLauder Directs 

p.m.; "Time Management", 
10-11 a.m. and 1-2 p.m.; and 
"The Employment Interview" 
11-12 noon and 3-4 p.m. The 
discussions in the morning and 
afternnon sessions will be the 
same. 

"How to Succeed in In­
dustry" will be a discussion of 
basic preparation and com­
pany awareness. When 
discussing basic preparation, 
four areas will be highlighted: 

viable summer programs, co­
op program, an understanding 
of company operations and 
the importance of a positive 
attitude when location is a 
question. The session on cam-
pany awareness will be 
discussed from the viewpoint 
of the logical and procedural 
steps leading to individual suc­
cess in industry. 

"Time Management" ses­
sion will deal with the concept 

of Managing by Objectives 
(MBO). Special attention will 
be paid to the effective utiliza­
tion of the work day, e.g., 
productive versus unproduc­
tive activities, means of 
measuring time i usage, as well 
as case study analysis. 

"The Employment Inter­
view" will highlight various 
techniques that can be used to 
get the most out of employ­
ment. The discussions will in-

Honors Program To Motivate Juniors 
By Sheila Snow 

A two-year honors research 
training program has been 
planned for highly motivated 
and outstanding rising juniors. 

Dr. William B. DeLauder, 
program director, says pur­
poses of Minority Access to 
Research Careers (MARC) are 
to increase the number of 
minorities that go into Ph.D's 
in Chemistry, Biological 
Sciences or related areas, and 
to develop, strong curriculum 
research opportunities in these 
fields to prepare students for 
careers in biomedical research. 

This research is directed 
towards solving health related 
problems. 

One Hundred-Five 

William B. DeLauder 

The departments involved in 
the program are Animal 

Sc ience , B io logy , and 
Chemistry. Any student ma­
joring in these areas is eligi­
ble to apply. Students will be 
selected on a competitive basis 
by a steering committee, com­
posed of Dr. DeLauder, other 
faculty members, and MARC 
honor students, based on their 
overall and major grade point 
averages, statement of career 
goal, letters of recommenda­
tion from science faculty, and 
personal interviews. 

Students must have main­
tained a minimum grade-point 
average of 3.0 overall and a 
3.25 in their major courses. 
They must express an interest 
in pursuing a Ph. D.degree in 

Aggies Make National Dean's List 
By Larry L. Jenkins 

One hundred and five 
students at A&T State Univer­
sity have been selected as in­
ductees into the 1978-79 Na­
tional Dean's List. 

These s t u d e n t s have 
demonstrated their abilities to 
excel in academic respon­
sibilities. They were selected 
for this recognit ion by 
academic vice presidents, 
r espec t ive d e a n s , and 

registrars. 
Over 37,000 biographies of 

outstanding students from ap­
proximately 1200 colleges and 
universities throughout the 
country were selected. 

The following students from 
A&T have been selected for 
this recognition: 

Johnny Allen, Joseph 
Anstead, Kathy Anderson, 

Angela Barnes, Glendia Black, 
Clementine Boyd, Videtta 
Brown, Charles Burch, Melba 

G. Butler, Glenn Caldwell, 
Warren Campbell, Sandra 
Carr, Sharon Carrington, 
James Carrothers , Wiley 
Cash , Vanessa C h a n c e , 
Dolores Clarke, Kay Cov­
ington, Clifton Craig, Audrey 
Davis, Deborah Davis, Emma 
Davis, Melissa Davis, and 
Delia Reese DeLoatch. 

Other students are Cheryl 
Deloney, Daryl Drew, Regina 
Duren, Janaka Edirisinghe, 
Herman Edwards, Peggy 
Faison, Reeda Frink, Bobby 
Fuller, Barbara Fulmore, 
Karen Funderburk, Loretta 
Gallishaw, Robin Giles, Ina 
Goocharan, Callie Graham, 
Debbie Grant, Gwendolyn 
Green , Virginia L. Green, 

Barbara Gregory, Sheila 
Guion, Maude Hall, Jo Ann 
Halsey, Montanette Harrison, 
Cynthia Haywood, Beverly 
Henry, Gloria Hicks, Jerial 
Hicks, Cyril Howell, Larry L. 
Jenkins, Mudlrat Jinadu, 
Donald Johnson , Maria 
Johnson , Audrey Jones , 
Karen Jones, and Karen A. 
Jones. 

Continuing, the list in­
cludes Julia Kendall, Keith 
Lindsay, Richard Ling, James 
Locus, Nathaniel Lyles, Nan­
cy Lynch, Michael Makotsi, 
Mary Mallory, Eric Martin, 
Tyrone Massey, Mollietta 
McBride, Angela McCain, 
Willie McCauley, Evelina 

Mclntire, Betty McNeill, Bon­
nie McNeill, Cynthia Miller, 
Venay Mills, Mary Mims, 
Cassandra Mitchell, and 

(See A&T , Page 2) 

biomedical science in the state­
ment of career goals. 

Those who are selected 
(See Winners Page 6) 

elude preparation for the in­
terview, dressing for the inter­
view, what recruiters look for, 
and what the applicant should 
look for. 

The interview clinic is coor­
dinated by the Career Plann­
ing and Placement Center at 
A&T, assisted by the Student 
Cluster Activities Council and 
the Student Government 
Association. 

There are no requirements 
to attend this clinic. Any stu­
dent may attend. Students at­
tending at least two sessions 
will receive, by mail, a cer­
tificate in recognition of their 
participation. 

The Career Planning and 
Placement Staff encourages 
students to use the services 
available to assist them . 

City Council Grants To Help 
Low, Moderate Homeowners 

By Prince Reed 
A total of 2,400 houses were 

brought into compliance with 
Greensboro Housing code and 
another 540 houses were con-
idemn ed last year, according 
to Chief Housing Inspector 
Clay Gordon. 

Gordon said approximately 
300 of the 540 houses con­
demned were also brought up 
to standard. The primary pro­
blems inhouses'failing to meet 
the code were leaking, plumb­
ing, exteriors in need of pain­
ting, bathroom floor tile in 
need of repair, and unsafe wir­
ing. 

"Our purpose is to arrest, 
remedy, and prevent the decay 
and deterioration of places of 
habitation," Gordon said. 
"Also it is to eliminate 
blighted neighborhoods by 
providing m i n i m u m re­

quirements for places of 
habitation for the protection 
of the life, health, welfare, 
safety, and property of the 
general public, owners, and 
occupants," concluded Gor­
don. 

Stating that occupants 
whose dwelling are icondemn-
ed receives a 30-day hearing 
notification with a list of 
repairs that need to be made 
after the 30th day hearing, oc­
cupants are given another 30 
to 60 days to bring the dwell­
ing up to standard. 

Unless there are unusual cir­
cumstances, such as a tenant 
on fixed income, the housing 
office will allow the maximum 
of 270 days to meet the hous­
ing code standard. 

"We notify occupants of 
the improvements needed and, 
if they don't comply withing 
the time period specified, we 
have no other alternative but 
to order them to move," 
stated Nadine Buchanan, a 

(See Several Page 2) 

Committee 
Holds 
Drive 

By Fiorina G. Byrd 
On Saturday, October 27, 

the vo te r r e g i s t r a t i o n 
committee at A&T held a voter 
registration drive at the 
student union and 'v'illiams 
Cafeteria. 

"The drive was a big success 
in comparison to the first one 
we held which was in 
September," said Bobby R. 
Hopkins, chairman of the 
voter registration committee. 

" W e reg is te red 
approximately 300 students 
this year. In September we 
registered only 34 A&T 
students who were residents of 
Greensboro," added Hopkins. 

The 300 students who 
rppktprorl Saturday were out-

(See Students Page 3) 
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Several Thousand Houses 
Brought Into Compliance 

(Continued From Page 1) 

housing inspector. Tenants 
are given 30 days to find a 
place to live after they are 
ordered to move, she said. 

To help low and moderate 
income h o m e o w n e r s 
rehabilitate their houses, the 
City Council has made grants 
and l ow- in t e r e s t l o a n s 
available to them, according 
to Bill Chambliss, chief of 
community development plan­
ning. The money is funded 
throughthe Federal Communi­
ty Development Block Grant 
Program. 

"The term of the loan can 
be up to 20 years with a cost of 
$5.55 per month for each 
$1,000 of principal that is bor­
rowed," said Chambliss. 
"The interest rate is only 3 
percent and a maximum of 
$20,000 can be borrowed," he 
said. 

To be eligible, a 

homeowner's family income 
must fall within the following 
limits: one person, $9,400; 
two persons, $10,800; three 
persons, 3>tz,200; four per­
sons, $13,600; five persons, 
$14,600; six persons, $15,600; 
seven persons, $16,800; and 
foi eight or more persons, 
$17,800. 

Homeowners who have an 
annual income less than 
$5,500 can receive a grant up 
to $6,500, but not to exceed 
the cost of repairs. If the 
rehabilitation work will cost 
more than $6,500, the owner 
may combine the grant with 
the 3 percent loan. 

The Housing Administra­
tion reported that most of the 
substandarded houses were 
found in the southeast and 
southwest sections of the city. 
They include areas surroun­
ding Lee Street, Logan Street, 

Asheboro Street, and the Glen­
wood community, west of Lee 

A&T's 
National 
Dean's List 

(Continued From Page 1) 
Haywood Morrison. 

The list concludes with Lin­
da Newkirk, Glenwood Nor­
ris, Teresea Peeples, Robert 
Per ry , Lance P e t e r s o n , 
Michael Prioleau, Wildra Ray, 
Gwendolyn D. Roach, Juliet 
Sampson, Belinda Simmons, 
Linda Smith, Carlton Spencer, 
Darlene Stephens, Donna 
Streater, Michael Suggs, 
Robin Thompson, Larry 
Thorpe, Linda Trevathan, 
Keith Tyler, Mary Tyson, 
Ricky Valentine, Gerald 
Vaughan, Carolyn Watkins, 
Mary Williams, Joyce Will­
ingham, and Joseph Withers. 

Street. The Brightwood com­
munity, located in the nor­
theast section of Summit 
Avenue also has a high por-
portion of substandard hous­
ing. 

But much of the housing in 
most of these areas has:, been 
brought up to standard, accor­
ding to Gordon. He said the 
major cause of the poor condi­
tions in these areas is the 
dwellings are rented and 
neither the tenants nor owners 
invest enough in the up-keep 
of them. 

"We found that multi-
family units consisting of one 
to four persons were in worst 
conditions than those units 
consisting of one to eight per­
sons," Gordon said. 

Through September of this 
year, the Housing Administra­
tion has reported 2,117 homes 
that have been brought into 
compliance; 433 units have 
been condemned and 56 
homes were in dilapidated 
condition. Out of the 433 
units condemned, approx­
imately 150 have been actually 
vacated and all of the 56 
homes reported in dilapidated 
condition were demolished. 

Trick or treating starts early for some. Photo by Woody 

Freshmen Aspire To Be Best 
By Larry L. Jenkins 

Stressing identification and 
unity as its organization 

o jec t ives , the 1979-80 
officers of the fresheman class 
anticipate to become the best 
freshman class as compared to 
previous ones. 

Believing that students are 
searching for something to 
indentify with, the freshman 
class officers feel that they 
could be a part of that needed 
leadership. The officers have 

Grant Helps Nursing School 
To Expand Lab Facilities 

By Thomas E. Harris 
The A&T School of Nursing 

has received federal monies 
that went towards major 
.renovations. 

Naomi Wynn 

An A I D P (Academic 
Improvement Developmental 
Program) Grant was recently 
implemented at Noble Hall. 
This grant allowed for 
renovations primarily on the 
third floor of the building, 
which houses a spacious 
l a b o r a t o r y for s t u d e n t 
utilization. 

Through this grant Noble 
Hall has additional personnel 
on the staff. Naomi Thomas 
is a nurse technician hired 
through the grant. Her 
primary job is to offer 
"assistance in the lab for any 
student having difficulty," 

Thomas said. 
The nursing learning and 

resource lab is a convenient 
avenue for students to practice 
nursing techniques, read 
articles and to view Films. 
Though the lab did exist last 
year, a wall to a former audio­
visual room has been removed 
for expansion of lab facilities. 

New equipment also has 
been installed in the school. 
Carrells (study booths) and 
cassette movie viewers have 
been purchased for the benefit 
of students. Evans, another 

nursing technician, "assists 
students in gaining knowledge 
and confidence in nursing" 
through the learning and 
resource lab," Thomas said. 

With the hiring of new 
personnel, and the expansion 
of the nursing lab, it is 
anticipated the current junior 
class of nursing (class of 81) 
will show c o n s i d e r a b l e 
improvement in outlook for 
the state boards. 

There was a marked 
decrease in the number of 
nursing graduates passing the 
state boards (over 65% failed). 

The class of '81 is expected 
to show some indication of the 
efficiency of staff and equip­
ment made available to them 
through a much higher percen­
tage passing boards. 

attended meetings pertaining 
to campus issues to become 
better informed, . thus 
enabling them to better serve 
as leaders. 

W a n t i n g s t u d e n t s to 
"recognize who and what they 
are all about," the officers 
hope to instill in students a 
type of unity, "as far as 
b r i ng ing themse lves 
together." 

"Before things can be dealt 
with on this campus, people 
have to get themselves 
together," said Parris Bryant, 
president of the freshman 
class. The Buffalo, New York 
native continued by saying 
that, once changes are made 
from within, the atmosphere 
on this campus will improve. 
People will start respecting 
each other. 

The first meeting of the 
freshman class will be 
November 16, at 7 p.m., in 

Merrick Hall Auditorium. 
This will be a rap session type 
mee t ing with top ics 
surrounding unity as the key 
issue. 

The class has presently 
participated in the rally and 
voter reg is t ra t ion drive 
sponsored by the Student 
Government Association.The 
freshman class will sponsor a 
disco Friday, November 2, 
from 10-2 a.m., in the gym. 
The class is also working 
closely with the religious 
institution on campus, and 
also plans to provide services 
for the needy as a project. 

Other officers for the 79-80 
school year are Norbert 
H o p k i n s , v ice-pres ident ; 
Zebrick Jones, secretary; Greg 
Ha l l , t r e a su re r ; Regina 
Poteat, Miss Freshman. 
Faculty advisor is Thomas 
Boyd. 

Counseling Service Boosts 
Student's Study Habits 

By Trudy Johnson 
The Counseling Services, 

under the directorship of Dr. 
Robert Wilson, will sponsor a 
series of stuuy sessions to 
boos t study habits for A&T 
students. 

The study skill sessions are 
designed for four consecutive 
evenings. Each session is 
complementary to the other. 
For best results, all four 
sessions should be attended. 

For busy students who want 
a little more improvement 
than their schedules allow, two 
attended sessions are better 
than none. 

The study skills sessions are 
for u n d e r g r a d u a t e and 
g r a d u a t e s t u d e n t s ' 
attendances. 

" T h e s e sess ions are 
c o n d u c t e d at d i f fe ren t 
intervals throughout the 
academic year," said Miss 

Marilyn Burnette, one of the 
Center's counselors. 

The four study skill sessions 
will focus psychological 
f ac to r s in f luenc ing 
learning/management; guides 
to taking better lecture notes, 
reading comprehension and 
writing skills, and how to take 
examinations. 

A word for examinations-
they are an essential part of a 
course study, but learning to 
keep calm and not to panic 
alleviates last minute errors. 
These usually rise from not 
proofreading the copy to be 
turned in to the instructor. 

All interested students who 
want to improve learning 
techniques and study habits 
are invited to attend all four 
sessions. 

These sess ions are 
sponsored November 5-8, 
from 3:30-5 p.m., in Room 
103 Murphy Hall. 
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"I've Been Looking For You... 
Haven't You Heard?" 

Patrice Russin's new smoker is blast ing the charts 
away and get t ing pr ime t ime air play. This l i t t le lady 
packs a voice l ike an "Emot ion" w i t h a message 
that's total ly love and a beat that is total ly disco. 

Seems l ike duos are " i t " this fa l l w i t h Curtis 
Mayf ie ld and Linda Cli f ford's new LP, "Between You 
A n d M e Baby." Issac Hayes and Mi l l i e Jackson 
haveanother duo together; the a lbum is "Royal 
Rappins." 

A lso new and w ide open are a few guys by the 
name of Sugar Hil l Gang w i t h a take-of f f rom 
Fatback Band ent i t led "Rapper's Del ight" ; 15 
minutes of disc jockey jargon. However , rumor has 
it, a lawsui t is in the mak ing f rom Chic for the 
background music used in the song (Good Times.) 

The O'Jay's a lbum " Ident i fy Yoursel f " is do ing 
we l l , rank ing number 19 in the charts of Record 
World. The group w i l l be in concert on November 
10, at 8 p.m. in the Greensboro Col iseum. Also 
bi l led on the same show are G Q w i t h their latest 
sucess " I Do Love You" and the Jones Gir ls "you 
Gonna M a k e M e Love Somebody Else." Tickets are 
$8 and $9. 

The Bar-Kays are r ight on t ime w i t h another 
k i l le r ! The a lbum " In joy" features a cut (that w i l l 
rock your mind) cal led "Move Your Boogie Body." 

Arch ie Bell & The Drel ls, Smokey Robinson and 
Glor ia Gaynor are a few who have "been a round" 
as it w e r e , and are st i l l p roduc ing the 
contemporary sounds of today. Consecutively, their 
hits are: "St rategy," "Where There's Smoke," and 
"Let Me Know. " 

There are tr ibutes to the late art ists Minn ie 
Ripperton and Donny Hathaway, as per formed by 
Stevie Wonder and The Whispers. 

Something that is sti l l a novelty and a good jam is 
the Yel low Magic Orchestra - "Computer Gamer . " 
A series of computer sounds incorporate this sci-f i-
rock. 

HAPPY 
HALLOWEEN 
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Ntozake Shange, poet-playwright-director and author of the highly successful ' .• or Colored Girls 
Who've Considered Suicide When The Rainbow Is Enuf" and "Spell No. 7," is the subject of a 
profile on CAMERA THREE, a series on the arts, Thursday, November 11, at 9:30 p.m. on UNC-
TV. 

Coleman Proclaims Fun Day 
By Fiorina G. Byrd 

Saturday, November 3, has 
been proclaimed as High 
School Day on the campus of 
A&T, according to Mike 
Coleman, director of athletic 
promotions. 

The purpose of High School 
Day is to give students from 
other high schools in North 
Carolina an opportunity to 
tour the campus, meet friends 
from other schools, watch the 
A&T vs. Tennessee State 
football game, and go to a 
disco at the Cosmos II. 

Students 
Put Forth 
100% Effort 
(Continued From Page 1) 

of-state, in-state and residents 
of this city according to 
Hopkins. " I feel that the 
success of this registration was 
kicked off mainly by the 

participation of students on 
campus. They put forth 100 
percent effort. These students 
asked me if they could help 
and therefore they became a 
part of the voter registration 

drive. Without their support I 
believe we might not have 
reg i s t e red t h a t many 
students,"asserted Hopkins. 

Hopkins stressed concern 
for the next drive which will be 
held November 17 from 9 
a.m. - 5 p.m. in front of 
Williams Cafeteria. 

"I would like to thank all 
students and Alpha Kappa 
Alpha Sorority for their 
support and service rendered 
on Saturday ," concluded 
Hopkins. 

There is no admissi 
charge for those high scho. 
s t u d e n t s who have an 
identification card from their 
school. The students are also 
asked to save their ticket stubs 
from the game for admission 
to the disco at the Cosmos II 
from 5-9 p.m., Saturday. 

Persons or organizations 

interested in serving as 
volunteers are asked to please 
report to Corbett's Sports 
Center (new gym) at 10 a.m., 
Saturday morning for further 
assistance. 

For more informat ion 
please contact Fiorina Byrd at 
379-7700 or Minerva Johnson 
at 379-7591. 

EXCEPTIONAL 
MANAGEMENT 

OPPORTUNITIES 
WE OFFER 

' s t a r t i n g salary up to 
|$15,000 increases up to 
[$26,000 in 4 years 

*30 days paid vacat ion 
annual ly 
* f u l l y f i n a n a c e d 
graduate programs 
*super ior fami ly heal th 
p lan 
*more responsibi l i ty and 
leadership oppor tun i t ies 
* w o r l d w i d e t rave l and 
adventure 
*prest ige and personal 

i i :growth potent ia l 

C U R R E N T 
OPPORTUNITIES 

• N U C L E A R 
ENGINEERING 
*B U S I N E S S 
MANAGEMENT 
• A V I A T I O N 
•NURSING 
• M E D I C A L S C H O C 
SCHOLARSHIPS 
• P E R S O N N E L 
ADMINISTRATION 
•CIVIL ENGINEERING 
• S H I P B O A R D 
OPERATIONS 

• L A W 
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ij: Most l iberal arts majors are also el igible :! 

| The Navy Officer Information Team will be visiting your campus on: 

||| Monday, November 5 at the Placement Office for Interviews $ 

]I Or contact your Navy Officers Programs Representative at: 

j; Navy Officers Programs 

1001 Navaho Drive 

Raleigh, NC 27609 

Or call TOLL FREE 1-800-662-7568 
J\ 



'Only The Strong Survive' 
When the going gets tough, the tough get going! 

This saying could mean different things to various 
people. This writer will interpret it in this way; "only 
the strong will survive." 

Many of you have classes that you must pass. You 
cannot in any way fail the course, but obstacles have 
been put in your way. Failing tests, can't complete 
work on time, and putting work off until the last 
minute all seem a part of the curriculum. 

Can you figure out the problem? No one person 
really can, but "only the strong survive." 

You do not walk alone as you go through your 
classes and to get to the point where you don't 
understand the teaching material, aids such as study 
groups and tutors in some areas are provided to aid 
you in your studies. Working together is the only way 
that you will be able to get something done. 

Don't give up, however, if everything starts to slow 
down, or it looks like it wants to stop. Learning how 
to deal with difficult situations is all a part of college 
life. As one student so bluntly stated, "If A&T 
students leave this institution and don't learn 
anything educational, they do learn how to deal with 
life. 

In many cases, such as SGA meetings where 
student support is constantly needed, organizations 
that you may be a member of an officer are always in 
need of constant support. 

Remember to support your cause, yourself and 
what you believe in, and you as a part of the strong, 
able bodies of society will survive. 

Leading editorials are written by the editor of the A&T 
Register. Such editorials will not necessarily carry a byline and 
will not necessarily reflect the opinion of the University or the 
entire staff. Staff members are free to write dissenting opinions. 
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LATE SEMESTER 
BLUES 

Campaign Successfully Eliminates Smallpox 

By Larry L. Jenkins 

In a campaign that started over 12 
years ago, the nation has successfully 
virtually eliminated the disease 
smallpox. Realizing that smallpox, 
along with many other diseases, could 
possibly increase and become a 
determent; t o th e population in future 
years, the national disease control 
council started this campaign. 

Using the advertising media, as a 
primary source, this campaign 
informed people and made them more 
knowledgeable about the disease. It 
also made them aware of the proper 
medication needed to prevent the 

spreading of smallpox. 
According to reports, the United 

States will save approximately $100 
million annually because it will no 
longer have to allocate as much money 
for checking passengers as they enter 
this country. 

This is just one of many classic cases 
revealing that once goals have been set 
they can be attainable through diligence 
and hard work. This campaign was not 
only held in the United States but was 
perpetrated internationally. This pro­
ves that countries can communicate ef­
fectively and unite for a common goal. 

Who Is Really Competent For President? 

By Jacqueline D. Pender 

Do you feel your reigning President 
Jimmy Carter is incompetent to handle 
the nation's problems? If so you and 
many others along with Senator 
Edward M. Kennedy feel that Carter is 
really handling the nation's problems 
very impecuniously. In other words 
Carter just isn't doing his job as well as 
anticipated. 

Senator Kennedy who became a 
Democratic/ candidate for the 
presidency last Friday decided to run 
only because of Carter's failure to do 
something about the rapid rise of 
inflation in this country. 

This writer feels this is not the only 
reason a man should run for president 
of the United States a prosperous and 
prominent nation. There should be 

other reasons within his agenda such as 
the Salt II Treaty, oil industry et cetera. 

We all know that Carter has not lived 
up to all of his expectations and most 
men who have been in his position have 
not. But, if Kennedy could have given 
better reasons supporting why he thinks 
he can do a better job than Carter, he 
would probably convince this writer if 
he should be our next president. 

As for now this writer sees no man 
qualified to untangle the chains that 
Carter and past presidents have gotten 
this nation into. 

Although there have been predictions 
made that Carter will win the 
Democratic election, this writer still 
feels that none of the present 
candidates are germane for the 1980 
presidency. 
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Black Unemployment Higher Than Overall Rate 
By Norman Hill 

This article was taken from 
the A F L - C I O News, 
Washington, D.C. 

Most economis t s and 
government officials readily 
agree that Black people suffer 
d i s p r o p o r t i o n a t e l y from 
unemployment. At the 
presen t t i m e , the 
unemployment rate among 
Black workers is 11.3 percent, 
compared to an overall rate of 
6 percent. For young Black 
workers, the situation is even 
worse-about one-third of all 
Black teenagers lack decent 
jobs. These dangerously high 
unemployment levels among 
Blacks prompted Alfred 
Malabre of the Wall Street 
Journal to remark that "amid 
Amer ica ' s p rospe r i ty , a 
* • * • • • * * 

depression is in progress." 
Malabre, who is certainly 

not prone to exaggeration or 
overstatement, has identified 
one of the most perplexing and 
potentially explosive problems 
of our economy—the stubborn 
persistence of an economic 
depression within the Black 
community. For at least 10 
years now, the economic 
condition of Black Americans 
has been relatively static. And 
Black unemployment rates 
have remained at least double 
the national average. 

While I note the enormous 
differences here between the 
n a t i o n a l and Black 
unemployment rates, I am not 
suggesting that the problem is 
exclusively or even primarily a 
racial one. True, some Blacks 

• • * * * * * * 

are jobless because of racial 
discrimination on the part of 
employers. But the vast 
majority of jobless Blacks are 
the victims of color-blind 
economic policies which 
des t roy t h o u s a n d s of 
unskilled, semi-skilled and 
service jobs irrespective of 
racial considerations. 

As happened during other 
r e c e s s i o n s , w o r k e r s in 
construction, manufacturing, 
and unski l led pos i t i ons 
expe r i ence the highes t 
u n e m p l o y m e n t r a t e s . 
Consider these statistics: In 
June the unemployment rate 
for construction workers 
(Black and white) was 9.6 
p e r c e n t , t he ra t e for 
manufacturing workers was 
7.7 percent, the rate for 

* • * * * • • • * 

common laborers was 10.3 
percent, and the rate for 
service workers was 7.2 
percent. By contrast, the 

jobless rate for white-collar 
workers was 3.4 percent, and 
the rate for technical and 
professional employees was 
only 2.5 percent. 

These statistics, I think, 
unmistakably demonstrate 
t ha t u n e m p l o y m e n t 
discriminates by class rather 
than color. In short, Black 
unemployment is so high 
today because the vast 
majority of Black workers are 
concentrated in occupations 
and industries—automobile 
manufacturing, services, retail 
t r a d e , a p p a r e l , and 
c o n s t r u c t i o n — t h a t a re 

• • * • • * * 
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El Monte, CA 
American Telecommunications 
Corporation 

Pomona, CA 
Pomona Division 

San Diego, CA 
Convair Division 
Electronics Division 
DatagraphiX, Inc. 

Fort Worth, TX 
Fort Worth Division 

Chicago, IL 
Marblehead Lime Company 
Freeman United Coal Mining 
Company 
Material Service Corporation 

St. Louis, MO 
General Dynamics 
Communications Company 
General Dynamics Corporation 
(Corporate Headquarters) 
Data Systems Services 
(Home Office) 

Montreal, Quebec, Canada 
Asbestos Corporation Limited 

Quincy, MA and 
Charleston, SC 
Quincy Shipbuilding Division 

Groton, CT 
Electric Boat Division 

Tampa, FL 
Stromberg-Carlson Corporation 

LAET'S TALK 
OPPORTUNITIES 

General Dynamics, a Fortune 100 company, 
will be visiting your campus this fall to talk to 
you about our broad range of high-technology 
programs at our 15 operating divisions 
throughout the United States. 

At General Dynamics you will have the 
opportunity to work with top professionals on 
state-of-the-art projects like the F-16. Cruise 
missiles. Trident submarines. LNG tankers. 
Sparrow missiles. Digital telephone equipment 
and more. Plus, depending upon your 

discipline, your career could start at one of our 
many locations shown above. 

To find out more about high-technology 
opportunities with one of the high-technology 
leaders in Telecommunications, Electronics, 
Data Products, Shipbuilding,AerospaceTactical 
Weaponry and other fields, contact your 
Placement Office. Or, send your resume to: 
Corporate Director, College Relations, 
GENERAL DYNAMICSCORPORATION.CN26 
Pierre Laclede Center, St. Louis, MO 63105. 

NOVEMBER 14 
An Equal Opportunity Employer M/F 

especially vulnerable to drastic 
cutbacks during economic 
slowdowns. 

How can the Black 
community best approach the 
unemployment issue? First, 
we must begin by recognizing 
the c lass-nature of the 
problem. Such a recognition 
leads us to advocate a broad-
range of economic policies 
designed to reduce the 
unemployment of all blue-
collar and service workers. 

It makes little sense, for 
example , to talk about 
solutions to high Black 
unemployment when the 
Fede ra l Reserve Board 
del iberately t ightens the 
money supply or when both 
Democrats and Republicans 
c o m m i t t hemse lves 
ritualistically to a balanced 
budget irrespective of the 
preva i l i ng e c o n o m i c 
conditions, or when our 
government enters into trade 
agreements which destroy 
t h o u s a n d s of j o b s in 
manufacturing industries, jobs 
which are the hopes of many 
Black people. 

All of these recession-
creating policies emerge from 

(See Community, Page 6) 

Inmate 
Needs 
Friends 

Editor of The Register: 
The spirit motivating this 

letter is purely humanistic. I 
feel neglected, extremely lone­
ly, and in desperate need of a 
warm and caring friend, so­
meone with whom to share 
love and correspondence. I 
am in prison but such are the 
ways of fate. Today you are 
lifted gently into the saddle 
and tomorrow the saddle is 
placed on your shoulders. 

At the age of 29, I am a gen­
tle person but I am also bold 
enough to believe in the 
possibility of the impossible. I 
am now painfully aware of the 
" A m e r i c a n D r e a m " , its 
elusiveness and how it can ap­
pear to be within reach, yet 
somehow you.can not touch it. 

My exile here is temporary 
and caused by my own hands 
but my loneliness is caused by 
the inadequate lack of campa-
nionship...so please write to 
me!!! 

Sincerely, 

James D. Phillips 
No. 051896 

P.O. Box 221 (73-103) 
Raiford, Florida 32083 
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The Pan-Hellenic Council will meet Wednesday, 
October 31, at 6 p.m. in the Student Union Room 
213. 

Phi Alpha Theta will meet Thursday November 1, 
at 7:30 in Room 108, Hodgin Hall. Career and 
graduate opportunities for History and Social Science 
majors will be discussed. All students are invited to 
attend. 

Delta Sigma Theta will be trick or treating on Oc­
tober 31, for UNICEF. They will be collecting 
aluminum cans for recycling. Please save cans and 
bring them by Zoe Barbee Hall suite 209A. Proceeds 
will go to needy. 

Games & Tournaments of the Student Union Ad­
visory Board are sponsoring Tournament night, Nov. 
1, 1979, from 7-10 p.m. in the Student Union 
Ballroom. Prizes will be awarded to the winners of 
Backgammon, Bingo, Spades, Dominos, Bid Wisk, 
and Po-ke-no. 

The National Society of Pershing Rifles (P/R's) 
will sponsor a Disco in Moore Gym Saturday, Nov. 3, 
following the A&T vs. Tennessee St. game, from 9-1 
a.m. Admission is $.50 with A&T I.D. $1.00 with 
other college I.D.'s. 

All Young Ladies interested in being a charter 
member of the National Society of 'CAPER's (Co-ed 
Affiliates of Pershing Rifles) are asked to meet in 
Campbell Hall Thursday,Nov. 1, at 8:00 p.m. All in­
terested are urged to attend. Neat Dress Please. 

The Pershing Rifle Society (P/R's) is having an in­
terest group meeting. Any interested persons are ask­
ed to attend an organizational meeting at 8:00 p.m. 
Thursday night in Campbell Hall Room 102. Neat 
Dress Please. 

The A&T Agricultural Extension Program has 
announced series of workshops in November to 
demonstrate budget ideas for Christmas. All 
workshops will be conducted in the assembly room 
of Coltrane Hall at A&T from 10 a.m. until 12 noon. 
The public is invited to attend. Monday, November 5 

Microwave Cooking Demonstration; Tuesday, 
November 6, .How to Prepare Inexpensive Gift Ideas 
from the Kitchen. 

North Carolina Fellows will meet Sunday, 
November 4, at 5 p.m. in the Memorial Room in the 
Student Union. Urgent business will be discussed. 

The Business Administration Club (B.A. Club) will 
give $10 to the person who can come up with a design 
for an effective emblem to be used by the club now 
and in the future at A&T. The deadline for the 
emblem design is Nov. 12, 1979. Designs may be 
turned into the B.A. Club office Room 309 Merrick 
Hall. This is open to anyone who may have an idea. 

Any Student Interested in the position of Student 
Government Secretary should come by and sign up in 
Room 218, Student Union. The deadline is 
November 9. 

Griot Society (History Club) will meet Monday 
November 5, at 12:00 in Room 313 Hodgin Hall. AH 
History and Social aScience majors, please attend. 

The Richard B. Harrison Players will be sponsoring 
a Halloween masquerade dance October 31 in Moore 
Gym from 10-1 a.m. 
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Some people are still trying to enjoy what little warm weather we have left. (Photo by Woody) 

Part-time 

Jobs Available In Southeast 
ATLANTA (AP) Workers 

looking for part-time jobs may 
find them more easily in the 
Southeast than elsewhere next 
year because of the growth of 
retail and wholesale industries 
in the region, a Federal 
Reserve Board economist 
predicted Monday. 

"I suspect that part-time 
voluntary employment will be 
more ava i l ab l e in the 
Southeast because of the retail 
and wholesale factor," said 
Charlie Carter, a business 
economist with the Federal 
Reserve Bank of Atlanta. 

V o l u n t a r y p a r t - t i m e 
w o r k e r s - - t r a d i t i o n a l l y 

homemakers and students are 
those who do not want full-
time work, Carter said. They 
usually are employed in 
se rv ice - re l a t ed j o b s in 
restaurants, department stores 
and the like. 

Carter said the service-
related job market is more 
robust in Southeastern states 

because the region has 
experienced a greater increase 
in demand for commodities 
than in other parts of the 
nation. But while they will be 
more ava i l ab l e in the 
Southeast than elsewhere, 
part- t ime voluntary jobs 

Community Must Approach 
Problem In Political Way 

(Continued From Page 5) 
community must approacn the 
problem from a political 
standpoint. 

Winners 
To Receive 
Full Tuition 
(Continued From Page 1) 

receive full tuition and a 
$3,000 stipend per year. 
Students selected this semester 
are Mary M. Monk, chemistry 
major; Dwaine Smith, Cyril 
Howell,, Valeria D. Knight, 
Shirlean A. Smith, and Eva L. 
Goins, biology. 

Heavy emphasis is placed on 
training the students to do 
research. Each student is re­
quired to conduct an in­
dividual research project and 
to write and present an 
undergraduate research thesis. 
The training includes a special 
on-campus summer program 
for research orientation, 
special honor courses in 
animal science, and a natural 
science honors colloquim with 
faculty and visiting lecturers. 

All of these recession-
creating policies emerge from 
the political process; they are 
the result of conscious deci­
sions made by elected of­

ficials. Thus, it seems to me 
that we in the Black communi­
ty must approach the problem 
from a political standpoint. In 
other words, we must begin 
now to build a strong, united 
political constituency, we must 
increase the political muscle of 
the Black community by 
registering people to vote and 
by stressing the importance of 
supporting candidates who are 
unambiguously committed to 
the goal of full employment. 

We must press our demands 
every day; we must out-
organize and out-lobby the 
political groups that oppose 
full employment policies.: And 
we must constantly strengthen 
our political power at' the 
community level so that both 
our friends and enemies will be 
aware that the Black vote 
counts. 

generally will become more 
scarce in all parts of the nation 
during the next economic 
period, he added. 

Car t e r said pa r t - t ime 
employment often provides 
advance i n d i c a t i o n s of 
changes in the overal l 
employment rate. But he said 
the Southeast 's healthier 
v o l u n t a r y employmen t 
situation does not necessarily 
indicate that unemployment 
will be less severe in the 
region. 

Carter also predicted that 
joblessness will rise more 
dramatically nationwide over 
the next economic cycle than 
was expected. He based that 
p r e d i c t i o n on figures 
concerning "d iscouraged 
workers." 

"Discouraged workers" are 
persons who are not currently 
seeking work because they 
believe they cannot find a job. 
The number of such workers 
rose sharply in the second 
quarter of 1979, while the 
overall employment rate 
remained roughly the same. 
Carter said a " r i se in 
d i s cou ragemen t " usually 
p recedes economic 

contractions. 
In addition, a low ratio of 

voluntary part-time workers to 
i n v o l u n t a r y p a r t - t i m e 
workers—those who work 
part-time because they could 
not find full-time work-
usual ly i nd ica t e s tha t 
unemployment is on the 
upswing, Carter said. 

Based on this ratio, Carter 
said he expects unemployment 
to rise more in the next year 

, than it did during the recession 
of 1974-75. 

The ratio of voluntary to 
involuntary part-time workers 
fell 7 percent prior to the 
1974-75 r ecess ion , but 
dropped about 9 percent from 
December 1978 to June of this 
year, he said. 



Tuesday, October 30, 1979 The A&T Register Page 7 

AGGIE 

By Raymond Moody 

N.C. A&T's search for a championship came to an 
abrupt end Saturday, losing to a tough Morgan 
State team 29-9. The Aggies have now been 
mathematical ly e l iminated from the MEAC 
conference championship. 

All year Aggie followers have been wondering 
what happened to the powerful team which 
defeated WSSU 14-7 in Winston-Salem. Since its 
opener, A&T has struggled offensively and,at times 
defensively, failing to jell as a team. Football fans 
should learn from the Aggies' season that one game 
doesn't make a season. After A&T's victory over 
WSSU, the Rams came together as a team and are 
now nationally ranked. I can't seem to locate A&T 
on any poll. Wait till next year, right? 

In A&T's loss to Morgan, the Aggie defensive 
backfield was constantly tested. Gerald Johnson's 
loss hurt the defensive backfield tremendously, 
yielding 276 yards in the air. Henderson and 
Holzendorf, Morgan's talented receivers caught 
eight passes for 136 yards and three passes for 108 
yards, respectively. Morgan leads the league in 
passing offense and Saturday, against A&T, the 
Bears proved worthy of their No. l ranking. 

The defensive line and linebackers played 
extremely well defending Morgan's running game. 
The Bears could net only 44 yards a game; maybe 
you don't need a running game. Anyway, after 
Morgan beats Howard, the MEAC will crown new 
champions. Hail to the Bears. 

This year, a year that was supposed to be A&T's 
rise to the top of the conference, is the worst year 
an Aggie football team has suffered in the last five 
years. And with the lack of depth plaguing Coach 
McKinley, he'd better have a good recruiting year 
because next year's team will be loaded with 
seniors. 

So now what's in store for A&T? Their season is 
practically over with only three games remaining. 
The best they can finish is 6-5 and with Tennessee 
State invading Greensboro Saturday, it's doubtful 
the Aggies can finish any better than 5-6.. 

Coaching Tennessee State is John Merritt, who is 
closing in on his 200th career win. Right now he has 
194 and you can bet he's expecting win number 195 
against A&T. He's coached Tennessee State to a 
136-27-5 record in his 17-year coaching career there. 
Merritt is known for his high caliber of football 

players he sends to the pros. As a matter of fact, 
Tennessee State University ranks third among all 
college teams in the number of pros it has turned 
out since 1964. with 145. 

Make Someone 

Happy. Give them 

a treat! 

A&T's offense struggles for a touchdown. 
' " : ' ' • * • --
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MEAC 

Race Turns Into Nightmare 
By Raymond Moody 

What was supposed to be 
A&T's opportunity to get back 

intothe MEAC race, turned into 
a nightmare Saturday as 
Morgan State ripped the Ag­
gies apart for a 29-9 win. 

A&T's loss completely 
eliminated them from conten­
tion for the MEAC crown. 
The defeat left the Aggies with 
an embarrassing 3-5 record, 1-2 
in conference play. 

Morgan is now 6-1, while 
ranked No. 6 in the NCAA 
Division II poll. 

The Aggies had plenty of 
opportunities to put more 
points on the board, but this 
afternoon they were denied 
from the goal line. Five times 
A&T drove inside Morgan's 10 
and could manage only three 
points. Twice A&T was in­
tercepted; then they fumbled, 
missed a field goal and even­
tually connected on a field 
goal. 

Morgan was known for 
iits- explosiveness and against 
the Aggies Morgan's big plays 
came through. 

Morgan's first score came 

Morgan State Moves Closer 
To MEAC Championship 

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

By Raymond Moody 
Morgan State took one step 

closer to the MEAC cham­
pionship Saturday, pounding 
NCA&T 29-9 in Baltimore. 
Morgan State's Darrell 
Coulter passed for 276 yards, 
including touchdown passes 
for 70 and 75 yards. The Ag­
gies were led by rookie 
Waymon Pitts's 124 yards 
rushing. But it wasn't enough 
as the Aggies suffered their 
fifth loss in eight games. 

Howard recovered from 
their 29-0 setback to the Ag­
gies last week to whip Hamp­
ton Institute 28-12. Raymond 
Cryer led the way, rushing for 
two big touchdowns on runs 
of one and nine yards. 
Howard, leading at the half 
14-6, clinched their victory 
when Brain Thomas passed 15 
yards to Greg Banks. Later in 
the fourth quarter, Banks 
recovered a fumble in the end 
zone. Banks was the leading 
rusher with 112 yards on 11 
carries. 

Delaware State crushed 
Kentucky State 16-2 as An­
thony Beamon gained 165 

yards and scored one 
touchdown. Kentucky State 
entered the contest as heavy 
favorites, but the Hornet 
defense played tough, holding 
Kentucky's offense scoreless. 
Their only score came when 
Delaware's Rod Lester was 
caught intentionally groun­
ding the ball in the end zone. 

S.C. State, apparently not 
as strong as i its leading its ; 
in the year, had to play catch 
up football against NCCU 
Saturday. The Bulldogs 
scored 17 fourth-quarter points 
to win 26-6 over the Eagles. 
Tailback Chris Ragland led 
the Bulldog attack which net­
ted 307 yards. Ragland had 
181 yards in 35 carries. 

U. District of Columbia's 
freshman quarterback Michael 
Young ran for three 
touchdowns Saturday and 
passed for another as they 
defeated UMES 28-21. 

Chisley, who leads the 
Firebirds in receiving, caught 
five passes for 96 yards with 
one of his catches in the third 
quarter setting up Young's one 
yard run. 

on a 21-yard punt return from 
Curtis Henderson which gave 
Morgan possession on A&T's 
28. Six plays later Angelo 
Proctor scored from two yards 
out. The two-point conver­
sion made it 8-0. 

Proctor enjoyed a good day 
against the Aggie defensive 
unit. On eight carries, Proctor 
gained an impressive 71 yards. 

The next score came later in 
the first quarter when Darrell 
Coulter passed 70 yards to 
Clarence Holzendorf. 

The play was quite peculiar 
since Coulter, throwing to 
another receiver, had his pass 
deflected. But Holzendorf 
caught the deflected pass and 
raced for the score. Later, 
Coulter put the Final points on 
the board when he connected 
32 yards with Michael Hender­
son for a score with 29 seconds 
left in the game. 

The Aggies scored on their 
next drive when freshman 
"sensation" Waymon Pitts 
galloped 31 yards for a 
touchdown. 

For the day Pitts carried 27 
times for a total of 124 yards. 
It was the second week, con­
secutively, Pitts accomplished 
this feat. 

A&T's next score came in 
the second half when Morgan 
was intercepted by Dennis 
Coit which placed the ball on 
Morgan's 35. On first down, 
Myers hit Frank Carr for 34 
yards down to Morgan's one. 
After three unsuccessful plays, 
A&T's Keith James booted a 
22-yard field goal. The re­
mainder of the game was com­
pletely dominated by Morgan 
State. 

A big play in the game 
which broke the back of the 
Aggies came when Coulter 
pumped, then he threw long to 
Curtis Henderson for a 
75-yard score. 
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We have 
positions to fill 
J B L President Carter has called the fight for tomorrow's energy the "moral equivalent of war." The front-page 

industry that's tackling the nation's greatest challenge needs superior engineering graduates. 
We can put your skills to work NOW. Kansas City Power & Light has choice career openings that place you 

now where your classmates will be in five years: at high levels of authority and responsibility with earnings and 
benefits to match. 

Kansas City Power & Light Company is a billion-dollar utility and energy supplier to over a million people in a 
major commercial and industrial center encompassing 23 counties in two states. 

Because of growing energy demand, expansion, and promotions, we need engineers with leadership capabilities 
to take over in these key areas: 

Fossil Plant 
Construction and 

Engineering 
Two Mechanical Engineers, one 
Electrical Engineer and one 
Civil Engineer are needed to 
review the work of and 
coordinate with Consulting 
Engineering firms involved in 
designing coal-fired power 
plants. These engineers will also 
design modifications to existing 
plants and at times will 
supervise contractors. 

District Commercial 
Operations 

We need two Service Engineers 
with degrees in Electrical or 
Mechanical Engineering (or 
Engineering Technology) to 
deal with representatives of 
our large customers and with 
Engineering and other 
departments of the Company. 
In addition to having good 
engineering skills, the graduates 
must be able to remain 
personable, articulate and 
poised under pressure. These 
positions require extra savvy. 

System Planning Generating Stations 
One Mechanical, Electrical or 
Industrial Engineer (or 
Engineering Technology 
graduate) is needed to perform 
studies of the cost benefit 
trade-offs of designated projects 
involving generation capacity. 
This individual will need course 
work in Economics and the 
ability to program in 
FORTRAN. Communication 
skills are also important as this 
involves interface with other 
departments. Familiarity with 
econometric modeling is 
an asset. 

Energy Management 
Services 

We need two Engineers with 
degrees in Mechanical or 
Electrical Engineering (or 
Engineering Technology) to 
explain electric heating, air 
conditioning, conservation 
techniques, and renewable 
sources of energy to customers, 
builders, contractors and 
consulting engineers. This 
involves constant research to 
remain current with the 
state-of-the-art. Candidates 
must communicate accurately 
and tactfully. 

Three Maintenance Engineers 
with leadership skills are 
needed for trouble-shooting, 
special studies, efficiency tests, 
and overseeing contract crews. 
This is a "fast-track" into 
supervision and management. 
Graduating students who will 
have degrees in Mechanical or 
Electrical Engineering (or 
Engineering Technology) are 
invited to discuss with us the 
following locations, some in 
congenial small town locales: 

Iatan Station — live in 
Kansas City 

LaCygne Station — live in 
Louisburg or Paola, 
Kansas, 20 to 40 
miles from Kansas City 

Montrose Station — live in 
Clinton, Missouri, about 
60 miles from Kansas City 

Distribution 
£ineering 

One Electrical Engineer who 
has taken power engineering 
courses is needed to design both 
overhead and underground 
distribution systems. Some field 
work is involved with 
opportunities to promote into 
Construction and Maintenance 
or technical supervision. 

Engi 

System Power 
Operations Staff 

The Manager of Generating 
Stations is seeking an 
exceptional Mechanical 
Engineer for top level staff. 
Electrical Engineers as well as 
Electrical and Mechanical 
Engineering Technology 
graduates will also be 
considered. This person will 
assist in administration of the 
Preventative Maintenance and 
Efficiency Programs and the 
Materials Management 
Systems. Candidates must be 
good at planning and, due to 
the nature of the liaison work, 
must be persuasive. This is a 
unique and very challenging 
opportunity requiring a sharp 
individual able to work with 
all levels of the Company. It 
also affords good exposure 
to top management. 

Our representatives will 
be interviewing on 
campus in the near future; 
please contact the 
placement office. 

An Equal Employment 
Opportunity Employer 
M/F/V7H 

K A N S A S C I T Y POWER & L I G H T KCPL 
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